

BID TABULATION - NOTICE OF AWARD
OPENING 11/03/22
SNOW SAND - TIOGA COUNTY DPW

| PROPOSER: | Lopke * | Angelo's* | Austin * | Dalrymple* | H.L. * | University* | Tri-City * |
|-------------------|---------|---------------|---------------|------------|----------|-------------|------------|
| | Gravel | Sand & Gravel | Sand & Gravel | Gravel | Robinson | Gravel | Highway |
| Catatonk, NY | \$17.95 | \$17.00 | \$15.80 | No Bid | \$18.80 | \$18.95 | \$18.58 |
| Barton, NY | \$18.70 | \$17.35 | \$13.50 | No Bid | \$24.40 | \$24.55 | \$17.25 |
| Berkshire, NY | \$21.70 | \$19.35 | \$16.60 | No Bid | \$23.50 | \$18.00 | \$15.70 |
| Candor, NY | \$20.45 | \$14.60 | \$15.80 | No Bid | \$18.10 | \$17.85 | \$19.69 |
| Newark Valley, NY | \$20.45 | \$17.35 | \$15.85 | No Bid | \$22.20 | \$20.00 | \$16.36 |
| Nichols, NY | \$16.70 | \$17.60 | \$14.55 | No Bid | \$23.35 | \$20.25 | \$19.25 |
| Owego, NY | \$17.20 | \$16.25 | \$15.00 | No Bid | \$21.85 | \$21.85 | \$17.47 |
| Richford, NY | \$22.45 | \$17.60 | \$15.00 | No Bid | \$23.10 | \$17.35 | \$15.45 |
| Spencer, NY | \$22.45 | \$14.00 | \$14.50 | No Bid | \$18.50 | \$18.50 | \$19.47 |
| Tioga, NY | \$17.20 | \$17.00 | \$14.75 | No Bid | \$21.35 | \$22.65 | \$18.81 |

\$ Per Ton Delivered to

| F.O.B. Plant Site | \$10.45 | \$9.00 | \$10.00 | \$16.00 | \$13.60 | \$10.75 | \$10.50 |
|-------------------|---------|-------------|--------------|---------|---------|---------|---------|
| Pit Location | | Spencer | Waverly | | Candor | | |
| | | Per Ton | \$11.00 | | | | |
| | | Washed Sand | Willseyville | | | | |

Low bid for FOB plant price is determined by price and transportation costs. It is understood that the Towns and Villages of Tioga County may also participate in the awarded bid prices by dealing directly with the proposer.

*** - CONTRACT AWARD**



Richard Perkins
 Deputy Commissioner