



**BID TABULATION – NOTICE OF AWARD
SMOOTH INTERIOR CORRUGATED POLYETHYLENE CULVERT PIPE
BID OPENING 1/19/2023**

PROPOSER: Advanced Drainage
Bands
DIAMETER \$ / L.F. \$ / Each \$ / End Sect

12" Pipe Band	\$7.30	\$11.45	\$252.00
15" Pipe Band	\$9.40	\$15.80	\$252.00
18" Pipe Band	\$14.20	\$25.50	\$339.00
24" Pipe Band	\$22.05	\$35.85	\$435.00
30" Pipe Band	\$34.10	\$83.20	No Bid
36" Pipe Band	\$44.05	\$115.90	No Bid
48" Pipe Band	\$75.20	\$190.70	No Bid
60" Pipe Band	\$138.50	\$314.00	No Bid

PROPOSER: Chemung Supply
Bands
DIAMETER \$ / L.F. \$/Each \$ / End Sect

12" Pipe Band	\$7.30	\$11.45	\$252.00
15" Pipe Band	\$9.40	\$15.80	\$252.00
18" Pipe Band	\$14.20	\$25.50	\$339.00
24" Pipe Band	\$22.05	\$35.85	\$435.00
30" Pipe Band	\$34.10	\$83.20	No Bid
36" Pipe Band	\$44.05	\$115.90	No Bid
48" Pipe Band	\$75.20	\$190.70	No Bid
60" Pipe Band	\$138.50	\$314.00	No Bid

PROPOSER: Bradco Supply
DIAMETER \$ / L.F. \$/Each \$ / End Sect.

12" Pipe Band	\$7.30	\$11.45	\$252.00
15" Pipe Band	\$9.40	\$15.80	\$252.00
18" Pipe Band	\$14.20	\$25.50	\$339.00
24" Pipe Band	\$22.05	\$35.85	\$435.00
30" Pipe Band	\$34.10	\$83.20	No Bid
36" Pipe Band	\$44.05	\$115.90	No Bid
48" Pipe Band	\$75.20	\$190.70	No Bid
60" Pipe Band	\$138.50	\$314.00	No Bid

PROPOSER: Lane Enterprises
Bands
DIAMETER \$ / L.F. \$/Each \$ / End Sect

12" Pipe Band	\$8.36	\$14.03	\$221.18
15" Pipe Band	\$11.44	\$23.36	\$221.18
18" Pipe Band	\$15.50	\$39.81	\$297.13
24" Pipe Band	\$24.95	\$56.13	\$381.32
30" Pipe Band	\$37.32	\$130.50	\$927.19
36" Pipe Band	\$47.03	\$181.57	\$927.19
48" Pipe Band	\$84.10	\$242.04	No Bid
60" Pipe Band	\$141.47	\$458.32	No Bid

TIOGA COUNTY, NEW YORK

Department of Public Works

477 State Route 96 Owego, NY 13827



☎ 607 687 0302 📠 607 687 4453 🌐 www.TiogaCountyNY.com

Gary Hammond, P.E. Commissioner Rich Perkins, P.E. Deputy Commissioner

It is understood that all Towns and Villages in Tioga County, N.Y. may participate in the awarded bid by dealing directly with the dealer.

*** - Contract Award**

Bradco Supply
80 Old Mill Road
Towanda, PA 18848
(570) 265-6167

Chemung Supply
PO BOX 527
Elmira, NY 14902
(607) 733-5506

Advanced Drainage Systems
4640 Trueman Blvd
Hilliard, OH 43026
(800) 733-7473

Lane Enterprises, LLC
16 May Street
Bath, NY 14810
(607) 776-3366

Authorized Distributors for ADS Inc.:

Blake Equipment
Bradco Supply
Chemung Supply Corporation
Core & Main
E.J. Prescott
Steel Sales
Ferguson

A handwritten signature in blue ink, appearing to read "R. Perkins", is written above a horizontal line.

Richard Perkins, P.E.
Deputy Commissioner
Tioga County Public Works